
From: Garson Design Services <mail@garsondesign.com>
Subject: Re: Logo/Website

Date: June 5, 2015 2:07:40 PM PDT
To: Teresa Clyde <RL1sceventdesign@aol.com>

Hello Teresa,

Are you receiving this via RL1sceventdesign@aol.com ?
If so that email seems to be working?!
Where do you receive those emails? SmartPhone? Work desktop computer. Home desktop computer?

Ok, went thru all online files and turned into pdf - hope that helps – I'll try to remember to convert in future.

Please respond to this email so that I know that you received it.

Thank you, 
Steve Garson

GARSON DESIGN SERVICES 
151 Del Loma Ct, Vacaville, CA 95687 - 1-707-439-5323
mail@garsondesign.com  www.garsondesign.com

On Jun 5, 2015, at 1:44 PM, RL1sceventdesign@aol.com wrote:

Can you please send the logo est. and drafts to us in a pdf?
 
In a message dated 06/05/2015 1:01:37 P.M. Pacific Daylight Time, mail@garsondesign.com writes:

Hello Teresa,

Not sure what the problem is with the logo cost estimate sent back on Monday 06/01/15.
Sorry but this really shouldn't be difficult.
Chron. list from oldest to newest:

1 Meeting NotesMay 29, 2015 5:02:59 PM
Meeting Notes sent.
06/05/15-9:58 am Got response that received.
Awaiting requested items to start web design work.

2 Emailed Logo/Bz Card Cost Estimate
Last Monday June 1, 2015 10:21:24 AM PDT
As agreed – Emailed pdf of cost estimate and Logo/BzCrd Design Sheet to you on (you can probably check through 
your Junk emails).
• Await approval and deposit to start work.
No response from Teresa or Michael.
Guessing email was not noticed or blocked by aol so I.....

3 Uploaded Logo/Bz Card Cost Estimate
06/04/2015 – 4:12:38 A.M. 

1. Email/Method not working – so changed to Option B to uploading the files and gave you the online address via
email, so you could download.
2. I have uploaded the emails online:
     http://garsondesign.com/proofs/sced/



3. Sent to all known emails of Teresa and Michael.
4. I will also send this via message/phone to your cell 707-812-8619 on 4:15 am same morning.
Got response – however recipient didn't use provided link to download Logo cost estimate(?) – so.....

4 Sent Online Address again
06/04/2015 – 9:20:57 P.M.

Sent link again.

I have uploaded the emails online:
http://garsondesign.com/proofs/sced/
Got response – however recipient didn't use provided link to download Logo cost estimate(?) – so.....
 

5 This email
06/05/15

1. This email (sent to all emails and posted online) with all previous sent emails and chronological history of emails, etc.
2. Sent to all known emails of Teresa and Michael.
Await response

Please respond to this email with what email you received it by – so I know which email is working.

Thank you, 
Steve Garson

GARSON DESIGN SERVICES 
151 Del Loma Ct, Vacaville, CA 95687 - 1-707-439-5323
mail@garsondesign.com  www.garsondesign.com

=

<Picture1.psd>

On Jun 5, 2015, at 9:58 AM, RL1sceventdesign@aol.com wrote:

6/5/2015
 
Good Morning Steve
 
Thank you for your communication with us.  I have received and downloaded your files.  1.) recap of the Web site building process. 2.)
Instructions on Uploading files to GDS. 3.) Copies of all our emails (Which I already have on file).
 
What we need is the LOGO. I don't understand what is taking so long for the est. pricing the logo development and proofs of your LOGO 
designs to be emailed us. 
 
We understand that you are making sure "what we want" in design of the Web Site and that is now well documented.
We have discussed, documented and now need to have something happen.
 
If we get anything done with this email, is to have the sample LOGOS emailed to us today.  We are quickly approaching our busy season and
need a Logo asap.
 
Theresa A. Clyde
Stephanie Curtan Stephanie Curtan Event DesignEvent Design
O: 707-863-8821 
C: 707-812-8619

http://www.facebook.com/pages/Stephanie-Curtan-Event-Design/423628304343810
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 In a message dated 06/04/2015 9:20:57 P.M. Pacific Daylight Time, mail@garsondesign.com writes:

Teresa,

I have uploaded the emails online:



http://garsondesign.com/proofs/sced/

Emails not able to send via RL1sceventdesign@aol.com due to spam filters.

SG

On Jun 4, 2015, at 9:08 AM, RL1sceventdesign@aol.com wrote:

Good Morning Steve
 
This email was received.  Please resend Meeting Notes and Cost Est.
 
Theresa
 

3

In a message dated 06/04/2015 4:12:38 A.M. Pacific Daylight Time, mail@garsondesign.com writes:

Emailed to:
RL1sceventdesign@aol.com
em1sceventdesign@aol.com
info@sceventsdeisgns.com
theresaclyde@sceventdesigns.com

mcc7711@aol.com

Hello Teresa,

Praying one of these might get through...
I think your aol spam filters are not allowing my emails to come through (and probably many others).

I sent emails on:
May 29, 2015 5:02:59 PM PDT Meeting Notes
June 1, 2015 10:21:24 AM PDT Cost Estimate for Logo/Bz Crds

I have uploaded the emails online:
http://garsondesign.com/proofs/sced/

I will also send this via message/phone to your cell 707-812-8619.

Please respond to this email so that I know that you received it.

Thank you, 
Steve Garson

GARSON DESIGN SERVICES 
151 Del Loma Ct, Vacaville, CA 95687 - 1-707-439-5323
mail@garsondesign.com  www.garsondesign.com

On Jun 3, 2015, at 2:29 PM, RL1sceventdesign@aol.com wrote:

6/3/2015
 
Hi Steve
 
As per our phone conversation on May 29, 2015
1.) You were going to write up our last phone conversation so that we were both clear on 
what we talked about and what you were working on.



2.) Estimated cost for Logo and date that you will have them ready.
3.) Basic layout for 3 pages of Website.
4.) Confirm in writing that each page we add to the Wedsite the charge will be $120.00
 
We really need to get moving on this,

Theresa A. Clyde
Stephanie Stephanie Curtan Event DesignCurtan Event Design
O: 707-863-8821 
C: 707-812-8619
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From: mail@garsondesign.com
Subject: Hello Teresa and Michael from Garson Design - Logo & Bz Crd CE
Date: June 1, 2015 10:21:24 AM PDT
To: em1sceventdesign@aol.com, mcc7711@aol.com

Hello Teresa and Michael,

Ok, got the cost estimates together for Logo and Business Card work.
Please find attached files named:
4972SCEDceBcLgo060115.pdf   176kb

Page 1 Logo Design and Business Card Design, Production and Printing.
Logo design is discounted so that bz card work is almost no cost : )
Page 2 Optional credit card payment
Page 3 Logo Design only

GDS Logo & Bz Card Designs
Please find attached files named:
garson_bcLgo060115.pdf 1.2mb
Examples of GDS logo and business card design work.

Please email back any questions.

Please respond to this email so that I know that you received it.

Thank you, 
Steve Garson

GARSON DESIGN SERVICES 
151 Del Loma Ct, Vacaville, CA 95687 - 1-707-439-5323
mail@garsondesign.com  www.garsondesign.com

=
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From: mail@garsondesign.com
Subject: Re: Web Site - Meeting Notes
Date: May 29, 2015 5:02:59 PM PDT
To: RL1sceventdesign@aol.com



Cc: mcc7711@aol.com

Hello Teresa,

Please find meeting notes per our conversation today 05/29/15-1:30pm
It's just a simple text file. 
Email back if any probs. - I can resend via text within a message.
Have a great weekend!

4972SCED-MNweb.rtf   8kb

Please respond to this email so that I know that you received it.

Thank you, 
Steve Garson

GARSON DESIGN SERVICES 
151 Del Loma Ct, Vacaville, CA 95687 - 1-707-439-5323
mail@garsondesign.com  www.garsondesign.com

PS - Working on Logo cost estimate next.
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