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From: mail@garsondesign.com
Subject: Re: Logo/Website
Date: June 4, 2015 4:12:35 AM PDT
To: RL1sceventdesign@aol.com, em1sceventdesign@aol.com, 

info@sceventsdeisgns.com, theresaclyde@sceventdesigns.com
Cc: mcc7711@aol.com

Emailed to:
RL1sceventdesign@aol.com
em1sceventdesign@aol.com
info@sceventsdeisgns.com
theresaclyde@sceventdesigns.com

mcc7711@aol.com

Hello Teresa,

Praying one of these might get through...
I think your aol spam filters are not allowing my emails to come through (and probably 
many others).

I sent emails on:
May 29, 2015 5:02:59 PM PDT Meeting Notes
June 1, 2015 10:21:24 AM PDT Cost Estimate for Logo/Bz Crds

I have uploaded the emails online:
http://garsondesign.com/proofs/sced/

I will also send this via message/phone to your cell 707-812-8619.

Please respond to this email so that I know that you received it.

Thank you, 
Steve Garson

GARSON DESIGN SERVICES 
151 Del Loma Ct, Vacaville, CA 95687 - 1-707-439-5323
mail@garsondesign.com  www.garsondesign.com

On Jun 3, 2015, at 2:29 PM, RL1sceventdesign@aol.com wrote:
6/3/2015
 
Hi Steve
 
As per our phone conversation on May 29, 2015
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1.) You were going to write up our last phone conversation so that we were both clear on what we 
talked about and what you were working on.
 
2.) Estimated cost for Logo and date that you will have them ready.
 
3.) Basic layout for 3 pages of Website.
 
4.) Confirm in writing that each page we add to the Wedsite the charge will be $120.00
 
We really need to get moving on this,
 

Theresa A. Clyde
Stephanie Curtan Event Design
O: 707-863-8821 
C: 707-812-8619

http://www.facebook.com/pages/Stephanie-Curtan-Event-Design/423628304343810


